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Operation & Maintenance Manual

12.1 SAFETY DECALS

General operating instructions 
for arriving on site, towing and 
departing.

12 – Other Information

Warns the operator that 230V 
equipment is fitted and in use 
in the cabin.No unqualified or 
unauthorised personnel are 
allowed to work on or maintain 
this equipment

Affixed to washing facilities to 
advise the operator that water 
in these units may not be fit for 
drinking.

General safety instructions. 
Roles and responsibilities for 
hirers and operators.

Generator service interval 
decal.

Emergency Stop button warning 
- only use in case of genuine 
emergency.

Indicates location of Emergency 
Generator Restart Button.

Instructions on how to use an 
external electrical supply.

Warns of proximity of hot 
surfaces or exhaust outlets.

Warns user to ensure the 
hydraulic cylinders are properly 
supported before being 
lowered.

Indicates that there is a vent 
that must not be obstructed.

Advises correct tyre pressure.

Warns of legal obligation not to 
smoke or vape in the cabin.

Warns user to make sure axle 
rod is locked in place before 
towing cabin

Advises user how to reset the 
generator after an alarm.
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